
INDUSTRIAL TOWELS

	 5-41455	 9-3/4” x 16-3/4” White, pack of 100	 PK	 1

	 5-41411	 9-3/4” x 16-3/4” Blue, pack of 100	 PK	 1

The economical alternative to scrap rags. 
Workhorse® Manufactured Rags is the first 
product to be made from Kimberly-Clark’s 
advanced new material – Hydroknit®. Durable, 
rag tough construction stands up to any task. 
Can be re-used time and time again. Available 
in white or blue.

Workhorse® Manufactured Rags

5-41455

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

	 5-05790	 WypAll Plus Towels—White, pack of 100	 PK	 1

Absorbs grease, oil, water and solvents from 
floors, hands, parts, tools and machinery.  
Tough enough for extra heavy jobs. Comes in a 
convenient pop-up box of 100 towels.

WypAll Plus

5-05790

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

	 5-34790	 Teri Reinforced Towels, pack of 126	 PK	 1

The Teri® reinforced towels feature multi-ply 
tissue reinforced with nylon webbing for added 
strength on the job. Made from 100% recycled 
paper. Towel size is 9-3/4” x 16-3/4”. Towel 
color is white. Comes in a convenient pop up 
box. 126 towels/box. 10 boxes/case.

Teri® Towels

5-34790

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

	 5-33570 	 Kimtex Shop Towels, pack of 100	 PK	 1

Long lasting Kimtex® stands up to oils, 
chemicals and solvents better than ordinary 
shop towels. Cloth-like feel and performance. 
Towel size is 9-3/4” x 16-3/4”. 100 towels/box. 
5 boxes/case.

Kimtex® Towels

5-33570

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE	

WypAll ShopPro X80 Towels
Like a rental shop towel, only more consistent. 
Engineered to feel like cloth and work even 
better. Absorbs more oil and water faster pound 
for pound than laundered shop towels. The 
ShopPro X80 is simply the heaviest duty towel 
in the Kimberly Clark line. 160 towels/box.

	 5-41041	 WypAll ShopPro X80 Towels, pack of 160	 PK	 1

5-41041

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

Shop Towels
Heavy duty reusable towels. For wipe ups of 
grease, oil, water, etc. 100% cotton material is 
pre-shrunk and hemmed. Each towel measures 
13” x 16”.

	 ST-4   	 Shop Towels, pack of 4	 PK	 1

	 ST-10   	 Shop Towels, pack of 10	 PK	 1

	 ST-24   	 Shop Towels, pack of 24	 PK	 1

ST-10

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE	

Terry Towels
100% cotton. Minimum of 14” x 17”. Pre-
washed for absorbency, fully-hemmed, all-
white, and reusable.

	 DTT-10  	 Terry Towels, pack of 10	 PK	 1

	 DTT-24  	 Terry Towels, pack of 24	 PK	 8

DTT-10

LUBRICANTS

CRC-1KB

	 CRC-1KB   	 Knock’er Loose® Penetrating Solvent – 13 oz.	 EA	 12

Knock’er Loose®  

Penetrating Solvent
An industrial strength, low viscosity penetrant 
designed to rapidly loosen and free seized, 
bound or frozen fasteners. This product also 
quickly permeates rust, scale, gum, grease 
and corrosion. Independent tests reveal that it 
outperforms its competition.

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE
	 CRC-8   	 Screwloose® Industrial Penetrating Oil – 11 oz.	 EA	 12

Screwloose® Industrial 
Penetrating Oil
A no compromise penetrant that attacks 
corrosion to free corroded fasteners and 
mechanical components. A super fast, 
powerful, concentrated penetrating solvent that 
loosens rust scale and corrosion and instantly 
penetrates minute and tightly fitted crevices.

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE
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NOTE: Item numbers in RED indicate Made in the U.S.A.




